


WHY CHOOSING AC PANEL?

Simple
For installation, it's just a 
simple "Plug & Play", there is 
no more headache about 
complicated wiring and 
configuration between DC to 
DC and then DC to AC.

Powerful
An AC panel starts working 
at 20Vdc to produce 
continuous power under 
low light condition, and its 
modular MPPT harvests 
20% more power.

Reliable
Our AC Panel is a perfect 
combination with high 
efficiency solar panle(IP68) 
and world's thinnest 
microinverter(thickness 
26mm) with lP67 waterproof 
enclosure. ensuring 25-year 
non-stop working
lifetime.

Smart
Our AC panel is not only a 
solar panel, it’s also an 
independent solar plant itself, 
which takes the advantage of 
module-level monitoring 
platform and shows power 
ouput and operation 
parameters by a smart device 
in real time. 



800W Solar System

Packing List

PV Panels 2 PCs DEYE Micro Inverter 800W 1 PC Mounting Bracket 2 Sets 5M AC Cable with Schuko Plug x 1



SOLAR PANEL ADVANTAGE



MICRO INVERTER ADVANTAGE



AC MODULE SPECS

I-V CURVE


